

Owner:	City of Mansfield				Jimmy Moore, Robby Isbell, Vicki Collins, Reps			Bid No.:	2015-25-01 through 2015-25-07	
Project:	Annual Contract - Chemical Bids							Date:	05/15/15 at 10:00 a.m.	

Bidder Name	ALUM 2015-25-01	CAUSTIC SODA 2015-25-02	CHLORINE 2015-25-03	LAS 2015-25-04	FLUORIDE 2015-25-05	PACL 2015-25-06	SALT 2015-25-07
THC Corporation	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
AIC	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Air Gas Specialty Products	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Altivia Corporation	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Basic Chemical Solutions	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Brenntag Southwest	355.15/dry ton	458.00/dry ton	No Bid	239.00/wet ton	No Bid	596.00/wet ton	183.80/dry ton
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ ✓	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ ✓

BID OPENING FORM

Owner:	City of Mansfield				Bid No.:	2015-25-01 through 2015-25-07	
Project:	Annual Contract - Chemical Bids				Date:	05/15/15 at 10:00 a.m.	

Bidder Name	ALUM 2015-25-01	CAUSTIC SODA 2015-25-02	CHLORINE 2015-25-03	LAS 2015-25-04	FLUORIDE 2015-25-05	PACL 2015-25-06	SALT 2015-25-07
Cargill Salt	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
CDG Environmental, LLC	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Chameleon Industries	205.00/dry ton			191.98/wet ton			
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
DPC Industries Inc.		405.78/dry ton	684.00/ton		535.00/wet ton		
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Finoric, LLC	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Fmc	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

BID OPENING FORM

Owner:	City of Mansfield					Bid No.:	2015-25-01 through 2015-25-07	
Project:	Annual Contract - Chemical Bids					Date:	05/15/15 at 10:00 a.m.	

Bidder Name	ALUM 2015-25-01	CAUSTIC SODA 2015-25-02	CHLORINE 2015-25-03	LAS 2015-25-04	FLUORIDE 2015-25-05	PACL 2015-25-06	SALT 2015-25-07
Fort Bend Services, Inc.							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
FS TI Chemicals		509.00/dry ton					
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
General Chemicals							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
GEO Specialty Chemicals	436.54 dry ton					558.00/wet ton	
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Gulbrandsen Technologies, Inc.						412.20/wet ton	
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda 2061/pound	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Harcross Chemicals, Inc.					560.00/ton		
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ

28/pound

BID OPENING FORM

Owner:	City of Mansfield					Bid No.:	2015-25-01 through 2015-25-07	
Project:	Annual Contract - Chemical Bids					Date:	05/15/15 at 10:00 a.m.	

Bidder Name	ALUM 2015-25-01	CAUSTIC SODA 2015-25-02	CHLORINE 2015-25-03	LAS 2015-25-04	FLUORIDE 2015-25-05	PACL 2015-25-06	SALT 2015-25-07
KA Steel Chemicals		457.00 / dry ton					
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Kemira							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Key Chemicals							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Lucier Chemical Industries, Ltd							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Morton Salt							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Pool Sure							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

BID OPENING FORM

Owner:	City of Mansfield					Bid No.:	2015-25-01 through 2015-25-07	
Project:	Annual Contract - Chemical Bids					Date:	05/15/15 at 10:00 a.m.	

Bidder Name	ALUM 2015-25-01	CAUSTIC SODA 2015-25-02	CHLORINE 2015-25-03	LAS 2015-25-04	FLUORIDE 2015-25-05	PACL 2015-25-06	SALT 2015-25-07
Shrieve Chemical Company		504.00/dry ton					
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Skyhawk Chemicals							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Salvay Fluorides							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Southern Ionics Inc.							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Southwest Chemical Services, Inc.							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Thatcher Company							
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

BID OPENING FORM

Owner:	City of Mansfield					Bid No.:	2015-25-01 through 2015-25-07	
Project:	Annual Contract - Chemical Bids					Date:	05/15/15 at 10:00 a.m.	
Bidder Name	ALUM 2015-25-01	CAUSTIC SODA 2015-25-02	CHLORINE 2015-25-03	LAS 2015-25-04	FLUORIDE 2015-25-05	PACL 2015-25-06	SALT 2015-25-07	
Thornton Musso								
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	
Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT	
Univar USA, Inc.	No Bid	495.00/dry ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	
Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT	
U.S. Peroxide								
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	
Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT	
USALCO								
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	
Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT	
Summit Research Labs, Inc.						506.00/ton		
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	
Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT	
Chem Trade Chemicals	224.00/dry ton	539.60/dry ton		199.00/wet ton		410.00/wet ton		
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	

BID OPENING FORM

Owner:	City of Mansfield					Bid No.:	2015-25-01 through 2015-25-07	
Project:	Annual Contract - Chemical Bids					Date:	05/15/15 at 10:00 a.m.	

Bidder Name	ALUM 2015-25-01	CAUSTIC SODA 2015-25-02	CHLORINE 2015-25-03	LAS 2015-25-04	FLUORIDE 2015-25-05	PACL 2015-25-06	SALT 2015-25-07
PVS Chemicals		500.00 / dry ton					
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
TDC, LLC		450.00 / dry ton					
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
Gasco Chem International LLC	210.00 / dry ton						
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ ✓	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ

Bidder Name	ALUM	CAUSTIC SODA	CHLORINE	LAS	FLUORIDE	PACL	SALT
	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda	Addenda
	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ	CIQ