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MANSFIELD TEXAS

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

MEDC Mail - Fwd: partial release and relinquishing of remaining funds

Natalie Phelps <natalie.phelps@mansfield-texas.com>

Fwd: partial release and relinquishing of remaining funds

1 message

Scott Welmaker <scott.welmaker@mansfield-texas.com>
To: Natalie Phelps <natalie.phelps@mansfield-texas.com>

Include with the MC

Scott Welmaker, CEcD

Director of Economic Development

Mansfield Economic Development Corporation
301 S. Main

Mansfield, TX 76063

817-728-3651 office

817-266-5890 mobile
www.mansfield-texas.com

-——-- Forwarded message -
From: George Sakakeeny <gsakakeeny@verizon.net>
Date: Thu, Jul 6, 2017 at 1:21 PM

Subject: partial release and relinquishing of remaining funds
To: Scott Welmaker <scott.welmaker@mansfield-texas.com>

Cc: George Sakakeeny <gsakakeeny@verizon.net>

Scott

Thu, Jul 6, 2017 at 1:27 PM

We are willing to relinquish our rights to the remaining $200,000 of funds provided the MEDC approves the +/-$122,000
of reimbursement we have requested and the assignment to RMA actually occurs

Text me or call if you have questions as | still cannot receive emails from you nor can my daughter forward them

George M. Sakakeeny, CFA
Managing Member

Colonial Square Ventures LLC
100 Colonial Square
Colleyville, TX 76034

Mobile: 214-704-9283

Email: gsakakeeny@verizon.net

past ICSC Texas State Director

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=89c5d706b58&jsver=IEZPUTRTfxl.en.&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15d192873ffae9fd&simI|=15d 19287 3ffae9fd
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